
 

Purchasing Summary 
EVENT # 4244 TITLE: Gasoline and Diesel Fuel COST: $5,607,687.39 

TYPE OF PROCUREMENT: Choose an item. 
ANNUAL CONTRACT  ☒ 
ANNUAL MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT  ☐ 

ONE TIME PURCHASE ☐ 

CONTRACT TERM (IF APPLICABLE) 
August 3, 2017 through August 2, 2018 
M/WBE (IF APPLICABLE) 
N/A 
MATRIX (IF APPLICABLE) 
N/A 

NOTES 

Recommend approval to renew an annual contract for gasoline and diesel fuel from Sommers Oil Company in the 
amount of $4,851,643.39 and Barrett Oil Distribution in the amount of $756,044.00 for a total amount of 
$5,607,687.39. The gasoline and diesel fuel will be used by various City departments to provide fuel and oil for 
equipment used in daily operations.  
 
This is a cooperative bid which was solicited by Chatham County, however, the opportunity to meet the low bidder’s 
pricing for tank wagon gasoline and diesel was extended to Barrett Oil Distributors under the local preference 
ordinance. Barrett Oil agreed to match the non- local low bidder’s bid for tank wagon diesel and gasoline.  
 
Sommers Oil Company and Barrett Oil Distribution agreed to exercise the renewal option of the contract for an 
additional one year term, with all prices, terms and conditions of the contract remaining the same.  
 
This is the last of four renewals options available. This contract was originally approved in Council on May 2, 2013.   
 
Delivery: As needed.  Terms: Net 30 days. The bidders were: 
 
       T/Loads-Diesel     T/Loads-Fuel     T/W Diesel     T/W Fuel 
L.B.        Sommers Oil Company (Richmond Hill, GA) (D)  $2,005,445.07     $2,846,198.32    No Bid   No Bid  
L.B.        Barrett Oil Distribution (Savannah, GA) (B)  $2,034,307.87     $2,900,942.06    $636,686.78   $119,357.22  
 Strickland Oil (Pooler, GA) (D)       No Bid             No Bid       $636,686.78   $119,357.22  
  Ports Petroleum (Wooster, OH) (D)   $2,006,022.33      $2,847,150.38   $681,537.72   $129,065.15  
 Mansfield Oil (Gainesville, GA) (D)    $2,004,175.11      $2,849,911.37   $652,750.92   $122,834.28  
 Great Lakes Petroleum (Alma, MI) (D)    $2,012,083.51      $2,851,386.74   $644,013.03   $120,942.98 
  
A pre-bid conference was not conducted as this is an annual contract renewal. (B) Indicates local, non-minority owned 
business. (D) Indicates non-local, non-minority owned business. Recommend approval. 
 
Local Available: Yes 
MWBE Available: Yes 
Total Sent: 18 
MWBE Sent: 6 
Total Received: 6 
MWBE Received: 0 
Vendor federally debarred/suspended: No 
 

 


